
 

Working from Home Checklist 

Subject: Religious Studies, Philosophy and Ethics – Bridging 

Work 

Work that was set Completed
? (Yes or 
No) 

Part 1 - Similarities and differences tasks on Birth 
Narratives in Matthew and Luke’s gospels.  

 

Part 2 - Read through the passage on whether 
Matthew and Luke’s Birth Narratives are historically 
accurate and answer questions 

 

Part 2 - Create and fill in table on supernatural 
events in Luke and Matthews gospel 

 

Part 2 – Watch episode 1 of Darmaid MacCulloch’s 
History of Christianity 

 

Part 3 – Create a key term glossary for philosophical 
arguments and definitions of God 

 

Part 3 – Explain the difference between inductive 
and deductive arguments, using examples 

 

Part 3 – (optional) Select and read a Philosophy book 
from the book list 
 

 

Part 4 – Use the videos to summarise and give your 
own views on the three main arguments in favour of 
the existence of God: the design, cosmological and 
ontological arguments. 

 

Part 4 – Read the information on the Problem of Evil 
and how atheists use it to argue against God and 
complete questions on this material.  

 



Part 4 – (optional) Use the Open University’s 
Philosophy resources through the links provided. 

 

Part 5 – Make notes from the introduction to ethical 
terms PowerPoint and answer all the questions/tasks 
in the yellow boxes 

 

Part 5 – watch the link 
http://www.bbc.co.uk/ethics/introduction/intro_1.s

html 

And then complete a mind map about ethics as well 
as answer tasks 2 and 3 

  

Part 5 – Make notes from the PowerPoint about 
‘what God commands’ and answer all the tasks in 
the yellow boxes. 

 

Part 5 – Read the story of Abraham and Isaac. You 
may want to make notes. Then answer 7 questions 
about the story. 

 

Part 5 – watch the link about Divine Command 
theory. Then answer the questions. For question 4 
you need to split your ‘page’ in half to summarise to 
different points. 
https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=hMOD7ofD9C
k 
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